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   EBMT 2018 Presentations 
 

Videos and slides from the Data Management Education 
sessions that took place at the annual meeting in Lisbon are 
now available on our web pages at 
http://www.ebmt.org/registry/data-management-education-
training 

 
 
MACRO taster sessions also took place and were well 
received. As the EBMT customisation is still in development , 
recordings are not available online, but we will keep you 
informed of our training plans as the project progresses. You 
can view the presentation “Introduction to MACRO” at the 
above link. 
 
The recent recordings of the ProMISe training sessions are 
also available to view. The following have been updated: 
 

 MED-A data entry training   

 HLA data entry training 

 Using Reports to clean your data:  

       List of reports and Video 

 
 
Thank you to all Speakers, Trainers, Chairs and Assistants 
who were part of this programme, and especially to the Data 
Managers who could attend. We take your feedback into 
account and the report of EBMT 2018 is available here 
 

   GDPR 
 
The following communication has been emailed to all EBMT 
members from the Executive Committee. 
 
Dear EBMT Member, 
 
EBMT is strongly committed to protecting the privacy of 
personal data that we maintain about patients, members and 
employees. As you may know, the General Data Protection 
Regulation (EU 2016/679) (GDPR) will be enforced on the 25th 
of May and in this context, we would like to take the opportunity 
to inform you about how EBMT processes patient personal 
data. For more information, please read the EBMT Patient 
Personal Data Protection Statement. 
 
Additionally, EBMT has developed a template Consent Form 
For Data Registration With EBMT to fulfil the GDPR 
requirements and to support EBMT Centres and National 
Registries in their implementation at a national level. The 
template has been produced by the EBMT GDPR working 
group, revised by the EBMT Board of the Association and 
Scientific Council, revised and endorsed by the EBMT legal 
advisors for compliance with GDPR, and finally approved by 
the EBMT Executive Committee. This consent form template is 
meant to be used as guidance and may need to be adapted in 
accordance to specific national regulations and the needs of 
the centre. The EBMT’s objective with the development of this 
template is to assist its Centre Members in the process of 
GDPR implementation as much as possible. 
 
Likewise, EBMT is also committed to protect the personal data 
that we maintain about our members, you can find further 
information on our Privacy Policy 
 
If you have any comments or questions about how EBMT 
processes personal data, please send them to 
Data.Protection@ebmt.org 
 
EBMT Executive Committee 

 
 

 

 

 

EBMT 2019 – Save the date! 

 
We look forward to welcoming data managers at the EBMT 
Congress next March in Frankfurt!  A full educational 
programme for Data Managers will take place on Monday 25

th
 

and Tuesday 26
th
 March. More details will follow online at 

www.ebmt.org. We welcome your ideas and suggestions for 
topics to include. Please email the coordinator of the DM 
programme: Khrystyna.Valkiv@ebmt.org 
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